
Registration Application

Dealership AuctionACCESS ID:

Trade or DBA Name:

Legal Name (if different):

Government Business ID:

RIN (Canadian Province of Ontario only):

Company Type:
Limited PartnershipGeneral PartnershipSole Proprietorship

Lot Address:

City: Colony (if applicable):

St/Prov (if applicable): Postal Code: Country:

Mailing Address:

City: Colony (if applicable):

St/Prov (if applicable): Postal Code: Country:

Bus. Phone Number: Bus. Fax Number:

Email Address: Website Address:

Check all that apply New Used Lease Wholesale Parts Salvage Export Rental

Automobile

Motorcycle

Moped

RV

Mobile Home

Trailer (Pull Behind)

Motorcycle (Off Road)

ATV

Snowmobile

Heavy Equipment

Boat

Personal Watercraft

Airplane

Dealership Information

Contact Information

Business Types

Date Business Started:

Business Corporation Limited Liability Company Unlimited Liability Corporation

Check only one
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Dealership AuctionACCESS ID:

Date:

Witness/Attester:

Legal Name of Entity (Corp/LLC/LLP/ULC/Partnership/Individual) Trade or DBA Name of Entity

The undersigned Entity (“Entity”) does hereby authorize AutoTec, LLC, its affiliate Auction Insurance Agency, and 
those of its customers that subscribe to AutoTec’s AuctionACCESS system (including Manheim Auctions, Inc. and its 
subsidiaries, ADESA Inc. and its subsidiaries, and all other customers subscribing to AutoTec’s AuctionACCESS 
System) and to which Entity registers or otherwise provides its AuctionACCESS number at any time (“Subscribing 
Customers”) to obtain, store, use and provide to Subscribing Customers the information contained on this application 
and other information regarding the Entity, including credit information, such as bank information and credit reports, 
and understands that AutoTec provides this information to said Subscribing Customers without verifying the same, on 
an “as is” basis, expressly disclaiming any express or implied warranties regarding such information. Subscribing 
Customers are not limited to businesses engaged in the automobile dealer or auction industries, but may also include 
other businesses providing goods or services to such industries.  By signing below, the Entity (1) agrees to the terms 
of this application, any exhibits hereto, and AutoTec's Terms and Conditions (as they may be amended from time to 
time) posted on AuctionACCESS.com, (2) warrants that it is solvent and that the information provided herein is 
complete, accurate and truthful, (3) acknowledges that registration in the AuctionACCESS System is no guarantee of 
purchasing privileges or credit, (4) agrees to be bound by the policies and procedures of each Subscribing Customer at 
which they are registered via AuctionACCESS , (5) agrees that AutoTec, LLC, its affiliate Auction Insurance Agency, 
and its Subscribing Customers, on their own behalf or on behalf of their respective sellers, consignors, or other 
customers, for any commercial or advertising purpose, may contact Entity using the telephone numbers (whether 
business, home or mobile numbers), fax numbers, e-mail addresses, and other contact information provided on this 
form, or at any other address, telephone number, facsimile number or e-mail address used in connection with Entity’s 
business, and (6) agrees to disclose AuctionACCESS numbers only to Subscribing Customers.  Each of the 
undersigned also agrees in his/her individual capacity that AutoTec, LLC, its affiliate, and its Subscribing Customers 
may obtain, store, provide, and use that individual’s credit information, including bank information and credit reports, 
in the same manner as described above for Entity.

Signature

By: Printed Name

TitleIts: of Authorized Signer (Owner/Officer/Manager)

of Authorized Signer (Owner/Officer/Manager)

of Authorized Signer (Owner/Officer/Manager)

Auction Name Phone Number

Franchise Name Franchise Number Franchise Name Franchise Number

Agreement

Signature

References

Franchise Information

Owners

Owner Name Owners AA ID Owner Name Owners AA ID
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